
[[SPM606655]] SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2500 - RIGHT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP415228
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SPM606655

SIMS METAL MANAGEMENT2500 S. PAULINACHICAGO, ILUS  60608Contact: RYAN WISEryan.wise@simsmm.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you inspect for thesource(s) of wear. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SIMCHIILUnique No: 10658459Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 22 Sep 2023
Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 05957246 (Generated: 10/01/2023 05:40:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415228 VCP401853 VCP399731 VCP348088Sample Date 12 Sep 2023 20 Mar 2023 05 Jan 2023 10 Feb 2022Machine Hours 9698 8469 7934 6910Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 240 230 207 200
 CONTAMINATIONWater % --- --- 0.249 ---Silicon ppm 12 4 28 17Sodium ppm 0 1 <1 <1Potassium ppm 1 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 781 103 74 418Copper ppm 119 41 248 1030Lead ppm 0 0 4 <1Tin ppm 12 2 10 24Aluminum ppm 3 <1 <1 3Chromium ppm 7 <1 <1 5Molybdenum ppm <1 0 1 1Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 6 <1 <1 4Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 144 57 1871 1822Magnesium ppm 2 <1 19 23Zinc ppm 181 76 883 785Phosphorus ppm 439 396 704 713Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 36 12 5 5

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 05957246 (Generated: 10/01/2023 05:40:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2500\Right Swing Drive [VCP415228] 12 Sep 2023 @ 9698.0 hrs

