
[[SPM595557]] KOMATSU PC490LC-11 85277 - LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP415266
Oil Type: TDTO FLUID SAE 30
Job No: SPM595557

JOHN KENO & CO750 RICARD LNELK GROVE VILLAGE, ILUS  60007Contact: LUKAS DECKERldecker@johnkeno.comT: (847)340-2432F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The oilviscosity is higher than normal.Confirm oil type.

Depot: JOHELKUnique No: 10658469Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 22 Sep 2023
Report Id: JOHELK [WUSCAR] 05957256 (Generated: 10/01/2023 05:37:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LUKAS DECKER - JOHELK

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415266 VCP406082 VCP05304027 ---Sample Date 12 Sep 2023 30 Mar 2023 30 Jun 2021 ---Machine Hours 0 2486 1908 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 190 190 98.8 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 378 101 109 ---Sodium ppm 7 3 8 ---Potassium ppm 45 7 12 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 378 204 305 ---Copper ppm 7 3 16 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 88 17 32 ---Chromium ppm 8 5 8 ---Molybdenum ppm 2 2 2 ---Nickel ppm 2 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm 4 2 2 ---Silver ppm 0 0 1 ---Manganese ppm 5 2 4 ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2415 2353 4031 ---Magnesium ppm 90 39 27 ---Zinc ppm 971 887 893 ---Phosphorus ppm 776 737 743 ---Barium ppm 1 0 6 ---Boron ppm 2 <1 13 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JOHELK [WUSCAR] 05957256 (Generated: 10/01/2023 05:37:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LUKAS DECKER - JOHELK
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KOMATSU KOMATSU PC490LC-11 85277\Left Final Drive [VCP415266] 12 Sep 2023 @ .0 hrs

