
[[SPM605741 BL DUKE]] SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2813 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP415214
Oil Type: EXTENDED LIFE COOLANT
Job No: SPM605741 BL DUKE

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: DAVE ENGDAVE.ENG@ALTG.COMT: (312)350-2560F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend drain/flush system,and refill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. Appearance is unacceptable.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 10658565Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 22 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05957352 (Generated: 10/01/2023 05:34:21) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415214 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5520 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 8.07 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 53.3 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -43 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance abnormal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05957352 (Generated: 10/01/2023 05:34:23) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2813\Coolant [VCP415214] 12 Sep 2023 @ 5520.0 hrs

