
VOLVO A40G 352780 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP05957356
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVDFORT MYERS, FLUS  33905Contact: TODD LARKtlark@altaequipfl.comT: F: (239)481-3302
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO0090Unique No: 10658569Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 25 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05957356 (Generated: 09/30/2023 20:07:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP05957356 VCP331167 VCP336726 VCP341589Sample Date 18 Sep 2023 04 Jan 2022 02 Jan 2022 14 Dec 2021Machine Hours 3652 7065 0 0Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 12.9 13.1 12.3Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.7 10.8 11.2 10.3Oxidation (PA) % 75 82 76 80
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2Nitration (PA) % 67 62 44 59Sulfation (PA) % 58 63 61 63Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.7 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 5 5 7Sodium ppm 2 2 2 2Potassium ppm 2 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 5 3 7Copper ppm 2 <1 4 26Lead ppm <1 <1 0 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 0 1Aluminum ppm <1 1 <1 2Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 50 41 39 46Nickel ppm 2 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1852 1447 1374 1684Magnesium ppm 558 430 425 484Zinc ppm 1158 987 959 1091Phosphorus ppm 936 803 778 935Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 35 41 63 48

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05957356 (Generated: 09/30/2023 20:07:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352780\Diesel Engine [VCP05957356] 18 Sep 2023 @ 3652.0 hrs

