
[[SW-24085-2 GRANT MAC]] VOLVO EC480E 310924 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP412474
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: SW-24085-2 GRANT MAC

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TONY PAYANtpayan@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofmetal. Resample at the next serviceinterval to monitor.Highconcentration of visible metalpresent. All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 10659109Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 05957896 (Generated: 09/30/2023 22:12:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412474 VCP354263 --- ---Sample Date 14 Sep 2023 26 May 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 7932 5705 --- ---Oil Hours 2100 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 164 161 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 210 392 --- ---Sodium ppm 7 12 --- ---Potassium ppm 10 23 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2595 2142 --- ---Copper ppm 7 5 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 29 66 --- ---Chromium ppm 13 18 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 2 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 2 4 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 15 17 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 47 109 --- ---Magnesium ppm 12 26 --- ---Zinc ppm 30 43 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1000 802 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 159 61 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 05957896 (Generated: 09/30/2023 22:12:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480E 310924\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP412474] 14 Sep 2023 @ 7932.0 hrs

