
VOLVO L90H 623696 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP418624
Oil Type: CHEVRON HYDRAULIC OIL  AW ISO 46
Job No:

ROMCO INC - AUSTIN BRANCH1150 WEST OLD SETTLERS BOULEVARDROUNDROCK, TXUS  78681Contact: ED MAYESEMAYES@ROMCO.COMT: (737)204-9402F: (512)388-2673
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The system cleanliness isacceptable for your target ISO 4406cleanliness code. The system andfluid cleanliness is acceptable. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.The condition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO0088Unique No: 10659795Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 25 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0088 [WUSCAR] 05958582 (Generated: 09/30/2023 08:56:22) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: ED MAYES - VOLVO0088

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418624 --- --- ---Sample Date 30 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 14692 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.0 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.35 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 1445 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 375 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 14 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 18/16/11 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 38 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 90 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 0 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 5 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 0 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 17 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 28 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 179 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 3 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0088 [WUSCAR] 05958582 (Generated: 09/30/2023 08:56:25) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: ED MAYES - VOLVO0088
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 623696\Hydraulic System [VCP418624] 30 Aug 2023 @ 14692.0 hrs

