
[[MARTIN MARIETTA]] VOLVO A60H 340053 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP423986
Oil Type: CHEVRON DELO GEAR ESI OIL 80W90
Job No: MARTIN MARIETTA

ROMCO INC - AUSTIN BRANCH1150 WEST OLD SETTLERS BOULEVARDROUNDROCK, TXUS  78681Contact: MATT MACHANNmmachann@romco.comT: (832)270-0121F: (512)845-7565
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0088Unique No: 10660012Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 24 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0088 [WUSCAR] 05958799 (Generated: 09/26/2023 14:17:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MACHANN - VOLVO0088

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423986 VCP420935 VCP322666 VCP293938Sample Date 28 Aug 2023 28 Mar 2023 17 May 2021 06 Mar 2021Machine Hours 7391 6735 4220 3845Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 134 115 133 132
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 28 8 11 8Sodium ppm 0 0 2 <1Potassium ppm 4 2 0 6
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 115 373 52 99Copper ppm 1 74 2 1Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 8 6 2 5Chromium ppm 2 4 <1 1Molybdenum ppm <1 1 2 <1Nickel ppm 1 2 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 4 <1 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 30 480 38 18Magnesium ppm 2 7 2 2Zinc ppm 9 236 17 36Phosphorus ppm 966 999 873 473Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 187 133 170 76

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0088 [WUSCAR] 05958799 (Generated: 09/26/2023 14:17:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MACHANN - VOLVO0088
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 340053\Drop Box [VCP423986] 28 Aug 2023 @ 7391.0 hrs

