
[[MARTIN MARIETTA]] VOLVO A60H 340053 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP423984
Oil Type: CHEVRON AUTOMATIC TRANS FLUID MD-3
Job No: MARTIN MARIETTA

ROMCO INC - AUSTIN BRANCH1150 WEST OLD SETTLERS BOULEVARDROUNDROCK, TXUS  78681Contact: MATT MACHANNmmachann@romco.comT: (832)270-0121F: (512)845-7565
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid.Confirm oil type. The condition of thefluid is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: VOLVO0088Unique No: 10660063Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 24 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0088 [WUSCAR] 05958850 (Generated: 09/26/2023 14:16:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MACHANN - VOLVO0088

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423984 VCP302862 VCP297159 VCP271867Sample Date 28 Aug 2023 17 May 2021 06 Mar 2021 05 Aug 2020Machine Hours 7391 4220 3845 3000Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 92.6 83.1 72.2 42.0
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 6 6 7 3Sodium ppm 0 3 1 2Potassium ppm 2 <1 1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 10 12 12Copper ppm 18 26 17 17Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 3 3 0 0Chromium ppm 0 <1 0 0Molybdenum ppm 29 100 100 13Nickel ppm 2 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 2 9 19 20Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2662 1425 1256 819Magnesium ppm 157 513 448 149Zinc ppm 1183 886 721 445Phosphorus ppm 983 806 666 455Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 79 422 364 95

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0088 [WUSCAR] 05958850 (Generated: 09/26/2023 14:16:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MACHANN - VOLVO0088
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 340053\Transmission [VCP423984] 28 Aug 2023 @ 7391.0 hrs

