
[[SWO-066005]] VOLVO A40G 341023 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP435426
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40
Job No: SWO-066005

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. No other contaminantswere detected in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10660727Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 26 Sep 2023
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05959514 (Generated: 09/27/2023 21:13:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435426 VCP408953 VCP396176 VCP369103Sample Date 20 Sep 2023 13 Jun 2023 07 Mar 2023 03 Nov 2022Machine Hours 8472 7952 7404 6919Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.2 12.3 12.4 12.7Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.3 9.0 10.4 11.6Oxidation (PA) % 78 83 78 87
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.1 0.2Nitration (PA) % 55 60 58 66Sulfation (PA) % 58 60 59 65Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 0.6 <1.0Silicon ppm 10 7 7 6Sodium ppm 2 13 2 2Potassium ppm 2 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 10 8 8Copper ppm <1 0 0 <1Lead ppm 1 1 0 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 4 3 2 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 43 43 42 42Nickel ppm 1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1755 1544 1624 1613Magnesium ppm 489 513 530 509Zinc ppm 1144 892 1096 1112Phosphorus ppm 979 756 890 902Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 43 51 55 38

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05959514 (Generated: 09/27/2023 21:13:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 341023\Diesel Engine [VCP435426] 20 Sep 2023 @ 8472.0 hrs

