
[[600139 CRC]] VOLVO EC160E 310218 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP349200
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40
Job No: 600139 CRC

PACWEST MACHINERY8207 SOUTH 216TH STREETKENT, WAUS  98032Contact: DAN SLAGLEdslagle@pacwestmachinery.comT: (206)482-4179F: (509)534-5286
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO1271Unique No: 10661532Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 26 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 05960319 (Generated: 09/28/2023 02:39:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAN SLAGLE - VOLVO1271

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP349200 VCP371488 VCP363355 VCP225300Sample Date 07 Jun 2023 09 Jan 2023 11 Oct 2022 11 Mar 2021Machine Hours 0 14095 0 10749Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A Changed N/A N/ASample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.4 13.3 13.2 12.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.4 8.2 11.2 ---Oxidation (PA) % 53 43 79 88
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 0.2 0.3 0.2Nitration (PA) % 60 57 68 62Sulfation (PA) % 50 46 62 66Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 11 7 16 11Sodium ppm 4 2 2 3Potassium ppm <1 6 2 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 23 6 9 11Copper ppm 2 2 1 1Lead ppm <1 1 0 0Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 1Aluminum ppm 8 2 4 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 21 12 35 45Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1941 1416 1739 1665Magnesium ppm 310 219 414 495Zinc ppm 1105 882 1103 992Phosphorus ppm 882 719 916 873Barium ppm 0 0 2 0Boron ppm 29 18 32 45

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 05960319 (Generated: 09/28/2023 02:39:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAN SLAGLE - VOLVO1271
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC160E 310218\Diesel Engine [VCP349200] 07 Jun 2023 @ .0 hrs

