
[[600139 CRC]] VOLVO EC160E 310218 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP379692
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46
Job No: 600139 CRC

PACWEST MACHINERY8207 SOUTH 216TH STREETKENT, WAUS  98032Contact: DAN SLAGLEdslagle@pacwestmachinery.comT: (206)482-4179F: (509)534-5286
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thechromium level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.The amount and size of particulatespresent in the system are acceptable.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The AN levelis acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO1271Unique No: 10661748Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 27 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 05960535 (Generated: 09/28/2023 02:39:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAN SLAGLE - VOLVO1271

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP379692 VCP371485 VCP362548 VCP05210860Sample Date 07 Jun 2023 09 Jan 2023 11 Oct 2022 11 Mar 2021Machine Hours 0 14095 0 10749Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A Not Changd N/A N/ASample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.9 42.1 42.2 41.3Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.43 0.47 0.52 0.419
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 11929 23019 64201 10545Particles >6µm 777 1774 5771 377Particles >14µm 18 18 164 12ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/17/11 22/18/11 23/20/15 21/16/11Silicon ppm 5 5 5 5Sodium ppm 5 <1 3 4Potassium ppm 2 1 0 5
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14 13 10 16Copper ppm 13 13 12 14Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 1 1 2 2Chromium ppm 13 13 13 17Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 66 62 41 76Magnesium ppm 4 3 5 5Zinc ppm 487 473 484 437Phosphorus ppm 395 358 384 371Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 0 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 05960535 (Generated: 09/28/2023 02:39:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAN SLAGLE - VOLVO1271
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC160E 310218\Hydraulic System [VCP379692] 07 Jun 2023 @ .0 hrs

