
[[600139 CRC]] VOLVO EC160E 310218 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP379877
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 600139 CRC

PACWEST MACHINERY8207 SOUTH 216TH STREETKENT, WAUS  98032Contact: DAN SLAGLEdslagle@pacwestmachinery.comT: (206)482-4179F: (509)534-5286
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO1271Unique No: 10662072Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 27 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 05960859 (Generated: 09/28/2023 02:39:48) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: DAN SLAGLE - VOLVO1271

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP379877 --- --- ---Sample Date 07 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 325 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 175 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 5 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 7 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 36 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1017 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 113 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 05960859 (Generated: 09/28/2023 02:39:51) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: DAN SLAGLE - VOLVO1271
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC160E 310218\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP379877] 07 Jun 2023 @ .0 hrs

