
[[W14719]] VOLVO A40G 352936 - BOGIE/CENTER AXLE

Sample No: VCP433548
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: W14719

HOUSBY HEAVY EQUIPMENT, LLC4410 SE 4 MILE DRANKENY, IAUS  50021Contact: RANDY VANDERLEESTrvanderleest@housby.comT: F: (515)964-2865
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. Thisplus the additive levels indicates theaddition of a different brand, or typeof oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0080Unique No: 10662652Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 27 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0080 [WUSCAR] 05961439 (Generated: 10/04/2023 20:49:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY VANDERLEEST - VOLVO0080

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP433548 VCP382349 VCP384169 ---Sample Date 21 Sep 2023 29 Dec 2022 31 Oct 2022 ---Machine Hours 1954 963 745 ---Oil Hours 1000 1000 500 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ---Sample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 48.7 49.4 49.8 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 3 2 4 ---Sodium ppm 1 2 2 ---Potassium ppm 5 4 3 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 191 124 235 ---Copper ppm 2 1 1 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm 0 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Chromium ppm 3 2 4 ---Molybdenum ppm 4 6 8 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 8 7 13 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 18 15 17 ---Magnesium ppm 1 2 <1 ---Zinc ppm 11 13 7 ---Phosphorus ppm 2341 2299 2476 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 291 289 290 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0080 [WUSCAR] 05961439 (Generated: 10/04/2023 20:49:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY VANDERLEEST - VOLVO0080
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352936\Bogie/Center Axle [VCP433548] 21 Sep 2023 @ 1954.0 hrs

