
[[DAVID GERAY]] VOLVO G970 41848 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP401109
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No: DAVID GERAY

403 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - FARGO3739 38TH ST SW, SUITE EFARGO, NDUS  58104Contact: SCOTT HANSONscott.hanson@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (701)356-4072
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The wear metal levels donot reflect the cause of the reportednoise. There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: ASCFARUnique No: 10662740Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 27 Sep 2023
Report Id: ASCFAR [WUSCAR] 05961527 (Generated: 09/27/2023 23:46:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT HANSON - ASCFAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP401109 VCP412779 VCE185401 ---Sample Date 21 Sep 2023 21 Aug 2023 17 Oct 2019 ---Machine Hours 0 0 10257 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed N/A N/A N/A ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.3 27.9 41.3 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 5 6 7 ---Sodium ppm <1 2 3 ---Potassium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 31 35 7 ---Copper ppm 2 0 <1 ---Lead ppm <1 0 1 ---Tin ppm 0 <1 0 ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 1 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 3 0 11 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 486 643 2795 ---Magnesium ppm 35 10 49 ---Zinc ppm 183 212 1080 ---Phosphorus ppm 314 363 939 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 84 87 61 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ASCFAR [WUSCAR] 05961527 (Generated: 09/27/2023 23:46:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT HANSON - ASCFAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO G970 41848\Transmission (Auto) [VCP401109] 21 Sep 2023 @ .0 hrs

