
[[54075 GAINES]] VOLVO L90H 624620 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP413508
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 54075 GAINES

GAINES & CO526 THREE SISTERS RDKNIGHTDALE, NCUS  27545Contact: BEAR PERONEgperone@gainesandco.comT: (919)524-4711F: (919)944-0091
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant. We advise thatyou follow the  water drain-offprocedure for this component.Recommend drain fuel if not alreadydone and flush before refilling withfuel.All metal levels are normalindicating no corrosion in the system.Sample consists almost entirely offree coolant. The fuel is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: GAIKNIUnique No: 10662771Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 06 Oct 2023
Report Id: GAIKNI [WUSCAR] 05961558 (Generated: 10/11/2023 16:13:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BEAR PERONE - GAIKNI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413508 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2500 --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.31 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 57.0 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GAIKNI [WUSCAR] 05961558 (Generated: 10/11/2023 16:13:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BEAR PERONE - GAIKNI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 624620\Diesel Fuel [VCP413508] 21 Sep 2023 @ 2500.0 hrs

