
[[X45355]] VOLVO SD115B 236978 - DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF)

Sample No: VCP434760
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: X45355

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Saint RosePO BOX 997SAINT ROSE, LAUS  70087Contact: DANA FOSHEEdfoshee@scottcompanies.comT: (504)461-0961F: (504)461-0970
Diagnosis
Fluid meets ISO 22241-2requirements and is suitable for use.Recommend drain diesel exhaustfluid (def) if not already done andflush with cleaner before refilling withdiesel exhaust fluid (def).{notapplicable} Excessive fuel present.The diesel exhaust fluid (def) is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: SCOSAIUnique No: 10662772Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 04 Oct 2023
Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 05961559 (Generated: 10/04/2023 15:53:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANA FOSHEE - SCOSAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP434760 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONHydrocarbon scalar NONE --- --- ---
 DEF CONDITION

Urea Content % 32.5 --- --- ---Density @ 20°C g/cm3 1.0876 --- --- ---Refracting Index 1.3825 --- --- ---Appearance scalar Layered --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Sample Color & Clarity

Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 05961559 (Generated: 10/04/2023 15:53:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANA FOSHEE - SCOSAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO SD115B 236978\Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) [VCP434760] 21 Sep 2023 @ .0 hrs

