
[[2644-1]] VOLVO EC250DL 210030 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP408335
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: 2644-1

MCCLUNG LOGAN17941 SUSSEX HIGHWAYBRIDGEVILLE, DEUS  19933Contact: RANDY KINGrking@mcclung-logan.comT: (302)337-3400F: (302)337-9083
Diagnosis
We recommend drain system, andrefill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is lower than acceptable. The pHlevel of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO1023Unique No: 10662779Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 28 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO1023 [WUSCAR] 05961566 (Generated: 09/29/2023 02:18:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY KING - VOLVO1023

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP408335 VCP380617 VCP318297 VCP306141Sample Date 21 Sep 2023 09 Nov 2022 09 Dec 2021 10 Feb 2021Machine Hours 12928 12040 10972 10082Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 8.27 8.41 8.21 8.28Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT NT NT NTPercentage Glycol % 35.7 40.0 37 35Freezing Point °C -3 -13 -10 -7
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal normal normal normalCoolant Color Yllow Yllow Yllow Yllow

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1023 [WUSCAR] 05961566 (Generated: 09/29/2023 02:18:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY KING - VOLVO1023
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250DL 210030\Coolant [VCP408335] 21 Sep 2023 @ 12928.0 hrs

