
[[594615 APTIM]] VOLVO A30G 740273 - BRAKE COOLING SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP414199
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 594615 APTIM

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: JOHN FARDELLAJFARDELLA@ALTAEQUIPFL.COMT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
The fluid change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10669037Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 28 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05962486 (Generated: 09/28/2023 14:42:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414199 VCP364402 --- ---Sample Date 22 Aug 2023 01 Sep 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 11091 10152 --- ---Oil Hours 4000 2000 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.8 41.7 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 11 11 --- ---Sodium ppm 4 3 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 7 --- ---Copper ppm 238 238 --- ---Lead ppm 2 0 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 2 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 1 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3337 3909 --- ---Magnesium ppm 27 28 --- ---Zinc ppm 1470 1643 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1223 1364 --- ---Barium ppm 0 2 --- ---Boron ppm 127 129 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05962486 (Generated: 09/28/2023 14:42:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 740273\Brake Cooling System [VCP414199] 22 Aug 2023 @ 11091.0 hrs

