
[[594455 MOSAIC]] VOLVO EC480E 314327 - RIGHT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP414652
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 594455 MOSAIC

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: JOHN FARDELLAJFARDELLA@ALTAEQUIPFL.COMT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10669043Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 28 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05962492 (Generated: 09/28/2023 12:29:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414652 VCP386212 VCP386144 VCP362286Sample Date 19 Aug 2023 02 Dec 2022 02 Dec 2022 12 May 2022Machine Hours 4013 3030 3030 2020Oil Hours 1000 1030 1000 1000Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 260 162 259 157
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 21 32 13 14Sodium ppm 0 <1 0 0Potassium ppm 0 <1 0 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 623 196 507 672Copper ppm 22 12 17 23Lead ppm 0 <1 0 0Tin ppm <1 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 4 6 <1 3Chromium ppm 4 3 4 7Molybdenum ppm 3 9 4 2Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 6 2 4 7Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 48 1036 63 46Magnesium ppm 13 40 20 5Zinc ppm 56 442 77 49Phosphorus ppm 954 814 912 915Barium ppm 0 2 2 3Boron ppm 136 89 88 116

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05962492 (Generated: 09/28/2023 12:29:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480E 314327\Right Swing Drive [VCP414652] 19 Aug 2023 @ 4013.0 hrs

