
[[S996 I PULL U PULL]] VOLVO L90H 625311 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP381079
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: S996 I PULL U PULL

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT8594 FRUITRIDGE ROADSACRAMENTO, CAUS  95826Contact: KRYSTAL GOODCHILDkrystal.goodchild@vcesvolvo.comT: (916)388-2244F: (916)388-9944
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO4485Unique No: 10669674Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 28 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO4485 [WUSCAR] 05963123 (Generated: 09/28/2023 19:08:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KRYSTAL GOODCHILD - VOLVO4485

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP381079 VCP355021 --- ---Sample Date 19 Sep 2023 13 Jul 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 4292 2168 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed N/A --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.7 40.1 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 16 15 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 8 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 3 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 92 128 --- ---Copper ppm 6 22 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 2 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 4 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 3 --- ---Nickel ppm 1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 3 10 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3747 4076 --- ---Magnesium ppm 15 11 --- ---Zinc ppm 1528 1641 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1210 1306 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 102 142 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4485 [WUSCAR] 05963123 (Generated: 09/28/2023 19:08:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KRYSTAL GOODCHILD - VOLVO4485
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 625311\Rear Axle [VCP381079] 19 Sep 2023 @ 4292.0 hrs

