
VOLVO L150H 6972 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP0007362
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: SHAWN NORTHCRAFTshawn.northcraft@altg.comT: (904)737-6000F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil viscosity is lower thannormal. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 10670539Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 02 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 05963988 (Generated: 10/02/2023 16:00:57) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0007362 VCP0007493 VCP0007535 VCP0007549Sample Date 25 Sep 2023 06 Sep 2023 12 Jun 2023 21 Apr 2023Machine Hours 6690 4999 4999 4999Oil Hours 1903 1224 1224 1860Oil Changed N/A N/A N/A N/ASample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.2 12.9 13.0 12.3Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.2 10.4 9.8 9.7Oxidation (PA) % 84 76 86 78
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 62 55 58 61Sulfation (PA) % 61 57 61 58Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.3 <1.0 <1.0 0.4Silicon ppm 6 4 5 3Sodium ppm 5 2 2 2Potassium ppm 29 <1 2 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 27 3 4 4Copper ppm 33 <1 <1 2Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 0Tin ppm 1 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 11 2 2 1Chromium ppm 2 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 40 41 43 44Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 26 0 0 0Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1342 1814 1682 1712Magnesium ppm 769 580 558 523Zinc ppm 1190 1200 1235 1143Phosphorus ppm 919 988 1003 957Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 10 40 37 38

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 05963988 (Generated: 10/02/2023 16:01:00) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6972\Diesel Engine [VCP0007362] 25 Sep 2023 @ 6690.0 hrs

