
[[550401683 LKQ]] VOLVO L90H 625142 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP435187
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 550401683 LKQ

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT22099 KNABE ROADCORONA, CAUS  92883Contact: OSCAR DEL CAMPOoscar.delcampo@vcesvolvo.comT: (951)277-7620F: (951)277-4550
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO4486Unique No: 10670889Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 01 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 05964338 (Generated: 10/01/2023 14:54:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: OSCAR DEL CAMPO - VOLVO4486

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435187 VCP369153 VCP285237 ---Sample Date 15 Sep 2023 12 Jan 2023 14 Sep 2020 ---Machine Hours 6000 0 1073 ---Oil Hours 0 0 1000 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.0 41.1 40.0 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 14 9 14 ---Sodium ppm 2 1 10 ---Potassium ppm 0 2 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 27 16 41 ---Copper ppm 0 13 <1 ---Lead ppm 0 <1 0 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 0 ---Aluminum ppm 3 <1 <1 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 2 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 10 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 1 <1 7 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3906 3259 4386 ---Magnesium ppm 19 7 11 ---Zinc ppm 1626 1387 1729 ---Phosphorus ppm 1317 1209 1384 ---Barium ppm 0 1 0 ---Boron ppm 158 111 122 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 05964338 (Generated: 10/01/2023 14:54:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: OSCAR DEL CAMPO - VOLVO4486
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 625142\Front Axle [VCP435187] 15 Sep 2023 @ 6000.0 hrs

