
[[X17833 APAC]] VOLVO EC480EL 314326 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCE67891D
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: X17833 APAC

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Jackson3860 I-55 SouthJACKSON, MSUS  39212Contact: DWIGHT MCDOUGALDMCDOUGAL@SCOTTCOMPANIES.COMT: F: (601)326-3359
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Cylinder, crank, or cam shaftwear is indicated. Sodium and/orpotassium levels are high. Fuelcontent negligible. The oil viscosity islower than normal. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO8771Unique No: 10670936Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 03 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8771 [WUSCAR] 05964385 (Generated: 10/05/2023 03:02:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DWIGHT MCDOUGAL - VOLVO8771

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE67891D --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4957 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.1 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.6 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 85 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 63 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 64 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 1.3 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 14 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 43 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 40 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 196 --- --- ---Copper ppm 5 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 39 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1408 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 396 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1014 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 820 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 12 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8771 [WUSCAR] 05964385 (Generated: 10/05/2023 03:02:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DWIGHT MCDOUGAL - VOLVO8771
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 314326\Diesel Engine [VCE67891D] 26 Sep 2023 @ 4957.0 hrs

