
VOLVO A25G 742259 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP431211
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No:

365 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - SAVANNAH1627 DEAN FOREST RDSAVANNAH, GAUS  31408Contact: JESSE WILSONjesse.wilson@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (912)964-9515
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Moderate concentration ofvisible yellow metal present. Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8531Unique No: 10671434Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 01 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8531 [WUSCAR] 05964883 (Generated: 10/10/2023 07:01:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JESSE WILSON - VOLVO8531

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP431211 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6286 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.6 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 18 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 9 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 306 --- --- ---Copper ppm 116 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 5 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 4 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2661 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1154 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1321 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 168 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8531 [WUSCAR] 05964883 (Generated: 10/10/2023 07:01:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JESSE WILSON - VOLVO8531
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 742259\Front Axle [VCP431211] 27 Sep 2023 @ 6286.0 hrs

