
[[607956 ASH GROVE]] VOLVO A40G 352940 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP440292
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 607956 ASH GROVE

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Confirmoil type. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10672303Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 03 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05965752 (Generated: 10/05/2023 03:03:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440292 VCP411664 VCP385900 VCP382998Sample Date 26 Sep 2023 30 May 2023 20 Dec 2022 02 Nov 2022Machine Hours 6962 5463 3441 3014Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 303 286 282 282
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 2 7 5 3Sodium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Potassium ppm <1 <1 2 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 21 112 69 68Copper ppm <1 1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 <1 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 0 3 3 <1Chromium ppm <1 1 1 <1Molybdenum ppm 2 5 4 5Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 4 3 3Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 76 132 108 79Magnesium ppm 13 17 19 15Zinc ppm 37 29 59 46Phosphorus ppm 1044 994 962 990Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 217 200 179 201

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05965752 (Generated: 10/05/2023 03:03:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352940\Rear Axle [VCP440292] 26 Sep 2023 @ 6962.0 hrs

