
[[A11111]] VOLVO EC200EL 314115 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP416930
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: A11111

A-JON CONSTRUCTION CO719 OLD MARPLE AVENUESPRINGFIELD, PAUS  19064Contact: 
T: (610)328-7128F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thealuminum level is abnormal. All othermetal levels are typical for a newcomponent breaking in. Elementallevel of silicon (Si) above normalindicating ingress of seal material.The BN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.The condition of the oil is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: AJOSPRUnique No: 10672656Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 03 Oct 2023
Report Id: AJOSPR [WUSCAR] 05966105 (Generated: 10/03/2023 13:21:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - AJOSPR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416930 --- --- ---Sample Date 18 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 550 --- --- ---Oil Hours 550 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.5 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.4 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 49 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.5 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 66 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 53 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 38 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 8 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 8 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 181 --- --- ---Copper ppm 22 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm 5 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 50 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 12 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 8 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2783 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 82 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1325 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1125 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: AJOSPR [WUSCAR] 05966105 (Generated: 10/03/2023 13:21:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - AJOSPR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC200EL 314115\Diesel Engine [VCP416930] 18 Sep 2023 @ 550.0 hrs

