
[[4794HO DERRY TWP]] VOLVO L90C 62351 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP414529
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40
Job No: 4794HO DERRY TWP

HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY CO MAINPO BOX 1957HARRISBURG, PAUS  17105Contact: CHAD HERRON
T: 7(175)643-3031F: (717)564-3568
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40.  Pleaseconfirm. Metal levels are typical for acomponents first oil change. There isno indication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO0025Unique No: 10673381Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 03 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0025 [WUSCAR] 05966830 (Generated: 10/13/2023 08:46:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHAD HERRON - VOLVO0025

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414529 --- --- ---Sample Date 25 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6219 --- --- ---Oil Hours 6219 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.6 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.1 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 76 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.4 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 57 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 58 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 26 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 46 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1701 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 536 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1144 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 948 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 65 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0025 [WUSCAR] 05966830 (Generated: 10/13/2023 08:46:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHAD HERRON - VOLVO0025
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90C 62351\Diesel Engine [VCP414529] 25 Sep 2023 @ 6219.0 hrs

