
[[RSO035504]] VOLVO EC550EL 310082 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP422326
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: RSO035504

COWIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY7950 PITTMAN AVEPENSACOLA, FLUS  32534Contact: HUGH DOBBSHDOBBS@COWIN.COMT: (850)479-3004F: (850)474-1602
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.The copper level is abnormal.In the absence of other significantwear metals, suspect copper due tosources other than wear (i.e. coolingcore). All other metal levels aretypical for a new componentbreaking in. Fuel content negligible.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. The oil viscosity is lowerthan normal. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO8247Unique No: 10674110Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 08 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8247 [WUSCAR] 05967559 (Generated: 10/11/2023 20:27:09) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: HUGH DOBBS - VOLVO8247

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP422326 --- --- ---Sample Date 25 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 643 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 10.3 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 4.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 65 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 84 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 57 --- --- ---Glycol % 0.0 --- --- ---Fuel % 0.7 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 31 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 --- --- ---Copper ppm 120 --- --- ---Lead ppm 3 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 87 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 4 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2082 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 25 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1181 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 955 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 18 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8247 [WUSCAR] 05967559 (Generated: 10/11/2023 20:27:11) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: HUGH DOBBS - VOLVO8247
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC550EL 310082\Diesel Engine [VCP422326] 25 Sep 2023 @ 643.0 hrs

