
[[ATLAS ORGANICS]] VOLVO L70H 624660 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP414646
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: ATLAS ORGANICS

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. Fuel contentnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal.Additive levels indicate the additionof a different brand, or type of oil.The BN level is low. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10675080Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 06 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05968529 (Generated: 10/06/2023 15:36:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414646 --- --- ---Sample Date 19 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2014 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 7.9 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 1.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 17 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 33 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 34 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.5 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 65 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 8 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 253 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 52 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 533 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 421 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05968529 (Generated: 10/06/2023 15:36:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 624660\Diesel Engine [VCP414646] 19 Sep 2023 @ 2014.0 hrs

