
[[A&R]] SENNEBOGEN 830 830.0.2003 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP424472
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: A&R

GREEN MACHINE SERVICES LLC13 SPYROS DRIVESOUTH AMBOY, NJUS  08879Contact: JOE GRZANKOWSKIJOE@GREENMSRV.COMT: (732)673-5920F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. Sodiumand/or potassium levels are high.Test for glycol is negative. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: GRESOUNJUnique No: 10675087Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 06 Oct 2023
Report Id: GRESOUNJ [WUSCAR] 05968536 (Generated: 10/19/2023 08:37:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE GRZANKOWSKI - GRESOUNJ

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424472 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 13150 --- --- ---Oil Hours 500 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.2 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.3 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 64 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.9 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 94 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 58 --- --- ---Glycol % 0.0 --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 43 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 86 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 40 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 84 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1980 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 482 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1390 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1183 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 39 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GRESOUNJ [WUSCAR] 05968536 (Generated: 10/19/2023 08:37:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE GRZANKOWSKI - GRESOUNJ
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 830 830.0.2003\Diesel Engine [VCP424472] 01 Jun 2023 @ 13150.0 hrs

