
VOLVO A30G 742658 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP0008086
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: SHAWN NORTHCRAFTshawn.northcraft@altg.comT: (904)737-6000F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
We advise that you perform a filterservice, and use off-line filtration toimprove the cleanliness of the systemfluid. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor this condition.Please specify the brand, type, andviscosity of the oil on your nextsample.All component wear rates arenormal. There is a moderate amountof particulates (2 to 100 microns insize) present in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. The oil is stillserviceable provided that thecontaminant(s) can be reduced toacceptable levels.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 10675442Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 05 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 05968891 (Generated: 10/05/2023 07:32:14) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0008086 VCP303970 --- ---Sample Date 02 Oct 2023 10 Mar 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 0 938 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.9 47.9 --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.39 0.471 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 22300 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 8091 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 706 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 22/20/17 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 0 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 1 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 6 --- ---Copper ppm 5 6 --- ---Lead ppm 4 3 --- ---Tin ppm <1 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 0 --- ---Chromium ppm 1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 0 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 93 93 --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 0 --- ---Zinc ppm 469 704 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 341 558 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 0 1 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 05968891 (Generated: 10/05/2023 07:32:17) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 742658\Hydraulic System [VCP0008086] 02 Oct 2023 @ .0 hrs

