
[[9726]] VOLVO L70H 622038 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP426395
Oil Type: CHEVRON 15W40
Job No: 9726

RECYCLE 14700 LAWRENCE STHYATTSVILLE, MDUS  20781Contact: MIKE DESJARDINSmdesjarkins@wbwaste.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Elemental levels of silicon(Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The BN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.The condition of the oil is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: RECHYAUnique No: 10676011Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 06 Oct 2023
Report Id: RECHYA [WUSCAR] 05969460 (Generated: 10/09/2023 08:30:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE DESJARDINS - RECHYA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP426395 VCP401099 VCP371070 ---Sample Date 02 Oct 2023 13 Apr 2023 11 Nov 2022 ---Machine Hours 7606 6625 5522 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.6 13.9 14.0 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 4.7 6.1 7.8 ---Oxidation (PA) % 76 76 70 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 1.1 0.6 0.5 ---Nitration (PA) % 74 73 81 ---Sulfation (PA) % 69 68 61 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 ---Silicon ppm 51 30 38 ---Sodium ppm 2 2 1 ---Potassium ppm 2 2 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 31 27 18 ---Copper ppm 2 2 2 ---Lead ppm 2 1 0 ---Tin ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 15 11 11 ---Chromium ppm 1 1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 98 91 55 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm 1 2 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1554 1522 1500 ---Magnesium ppm 465 482 795 ---Zinc ppm 1370 1350 1253 ---Phosphorus ppm 1088 1078 1064 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 106 175 4 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RECHYA [WUSCAR] 05969460 (Generated: 10/09/2023 08:30:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE DESJARDINS - RECHYA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 622038\Diesel Engine [VCP426395] 02 Oct 2023 @ 7606.0 hrs

