
[[9635 TOLSON]] ALJON 30131 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP426082
Oil Type: MV 32
Job No: 9635 TOLSON

PLEASANT EXCAVATING COMPANY INC24024 FREDERICK ROADCLARKSBURG, MDUS  20871Contact: H TRENTHTRENT@PLEASANTS.ORGT: (301)252-5635F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofmetal. Resample at the next serviceinterval to monitor. We were unableto perform a particle count due tometal particles present in thissample.Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. All componentwear rates are normal. No othercontaminants were detected in theoil. The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: PLECLAUnique No: 10676191Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 12 Oct 2023
Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 05969640 (Generated: 10/16/2023 06:23:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP426082 VCP422892 VCP407891 VCP387929Sample Date 20 Sep 2023 24 Jul 2023 01 Jun 2023 17 Apr 2023Machine Hours 1938 1665 1445 1162Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.6 27.6 26.6 26.8Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.38 0.43 0.44 0.38
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm --- 17675 1500 795Particles >6µm --- 787 667 208Particles >14µm --- 27 146 29ISO 4406:1999 (c) --- 21/17/12 18/17/14 17/15/12Silicon ppm 2 1 2 2Sodium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Potassium ppm <1 <1 2 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 8 9 8Copper ppm 21 17 20 13Lead ppm 1 0 <1 0Tin ppm 1 1 2 <1Aluminum ppm 0 0 0 0Chromium ppm <1 <1 0 0Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 0 2Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 0 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 109 107 118 99Magnesium ppm 9 13 13 14Zinc ppm 331 305 379 366Phosphorus ppm 398 397 392 377Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 0 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 05969640 (Generated: 10/16/2023 06:23:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ALJON ALJON 30131\Hydraulic System [VCP426082] 20 Sep 2023 @ 1938.0 hrs

