
[[49876]] VOLVO EC300E 310448 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP431142
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40
Job No: 49876

367 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - BUFORD3779 RYDER BLVDBUFORD, GAUS  30519Contact: Dana Vaccarodana.vaccaro@ascendummachinery.comT: (678)318-9500F: (678)318-9534
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40.  Pleaseconfirm. All component wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO8529Unique No: 10682090Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 05 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8529 [WUSCAR] 05970140 (Generated: 10/10/2023 11:53:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dana Vaccaro - VOLVO8529

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP431142 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9070 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.8 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.7 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 78 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 86 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 58 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 9 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 42 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1473 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 764 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1042 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 835 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 16 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8529 [WUSCAR] 05970140 (Generated: 10/10/2023 11:53:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dana Vaccaro - VOLVO8529
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC300E 310448\Diesel Engine [VCP431142] 02 Oct 2023 @ 9070.0 hrs

