
VOLVO A30G 753219 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP412595
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No:

SANTA ROSA COUNTY LANDFILLS6337 DA LISA RDMILTON, FLUS  32583Contact: ROLAND MCKINNONrolandm@santarosa.fl.govT: (850)777-0573F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a light amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: SANMILFLUnique No: 10682259Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 06 Oct 2023
Report Id: SANMILFL [WUSCAR] 05970309 (Generated: 10/11/2023 08:51:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROLAND MCKINNON - SANMILFL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412595 VCP423673 --- ---Sample Date 13 Sep 2023 12 Jun 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1000 500 --- ---Oil Hours 1000 500 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.4 44.0 --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.48 0.45 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 5222 428 --- ---Particles >6µm 1893 138 --- ---Particles >14µm 238 14 --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/18/15 16/14/11 --- ---Silicon ppm 3 2 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 <1 --- ---Copper ppm 3 2 --- ---Lead ppm 2 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 0 0 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 60 56 --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 0 --- ---Zinc ppm 443 459 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 331 360 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 0 0 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SANMILFL [WUSCAR] 05970309 (Generated: 10/11/2023 08:51:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROLAND MCKINNON - SANMILFL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 753219\Hydraulic System [VCP412595] 13 Sep 2023 @ 1000.0 hrs

