
[[3751HR]] VOLVO L220H 2578 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP408032
Oil Type: SUNOCO SUPER-C SAE 15W40
Job No: 3751HR

PENNSYLVANIA SUPPLY833 PAXTON STREETHARRISBURG, PAUS  17104Contact: KEVIN TAYLORKTAYLOR@OLDCASTLEMATERIALS.COMT: (717)236-7040F: (717)238-5831
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: PENHARUnique No: 10683027Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 10 Oct 2023
Report Id: PENHAR [WUSCAR] 05971077 (Generated: 10/13/2023 08:47:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN TAYLOR - PENHAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP408032 VCP247952 VCP214677 VCP207703Sample Date 14 Sep 2023 29 May 2019 15 Dec 2017 11 Aug 2017Machine Hours 16109 5574 1876 611Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.7 12.3 12.55 11.22Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.2 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 50 53 64 64
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 0.2 0 0.1Nitration (PA) % 55 59 50 58Sulfation (PA) % 47 50 50 50Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 3 3 5 23Sodium ppm 5 2 9 5Potassium ppm 0 8 <1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 6 8 17Copper ppm <1 <1 10 512Lead ppm <1 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 1 0 0Aluminum ppm 5 <1 1 2Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 49 56 44 44Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm 3 1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 2Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1285 1280 1608 1267Magnesium ppm 790 817 461 824Zinc ppm 1164 1125 826 1020Phosphorus ppm 930 994 710 855Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 7 21 32 35

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PENHAR [WUSCAR] 05971077 (Generated: 10/13/2023 08:47:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN TAYLOR - PENHAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 2578\Diesel Engine [VCP408032] 14 Sep 2023 @ 16109.0 hrs

