
VOLVO A60H 350157 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP433233
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

MORGAN CORPPO BOX 3555SPARTANBURG, SCUS  29304Contact: MICHAEL SHEPARDmshepard@morgan-corp.comT: (864)433-8800F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thesystem. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fuel. Thecondition of the fuel is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: MORSPAUnique No: 10683824Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 15 Oct 2023
Report Id: MORSPA [WUSCAR] 05971874 (Generated: 10/16/2023 08:04:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL SHEPARD - MORSPA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP433233 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.004 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MORSPA [WUSCAR] 05971874 (Generated: 10/16/2023 08:04:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL SHEPARD - MORSPA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 350157\Diesel Fuel [VCP433233] 05 Oct 2023 @ .0 hrs

