
[[D38062 KISSER STONE]] VOLVO L70F 25677 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP360806
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: D38062 KISSER STONE

ARING EQUIPMENT COMPANY INC - GREEN BAYPO BOX 5276DEPERE, WIUS  54115Contact: DEL VAUGHNdvaughn@aring.comT: (920)336-3601F: (920)337-6291
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid change at thetime of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thefluid viscosity is higher than normal.Additive levels indicate the additionof a different brand, or type of fluid.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0072Unique No: 10685420Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 11 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0072 [WUSCAR] 05973470 (Generated: 10/11/2023 18:58:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DEL VAUGHN - VOLVO0072

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP360806 VCE108560 VCE087088 VCE082851Sample Date 05 Oct 2023 23 May 2011 16 Feb 2011 13 Dec 2010Machine Hours 13939 2085 1510 1072Oil Hours 0 2085 449 1071Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ATTENTION ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.1 29.25 30.28 78.51
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 8 10 13 15Sodium ppm <1 5 5 6Potassium ppm 2 0 1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 32 122 133 142Copper ppm 7 4 4 4Lead ppm 2 4 1 1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 1 6 5 4Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 21 0 0 0Nickel ppm <1 1 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 5 6 6Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 477 149 164 211Magnesium ppm 365 <1 <1 0Zinc ppm 479 47 54 54Phosphorus ppm 553 233 258 349Barium ppm 0 2 3 0Boron ppm 54 69 87 94

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0072 [WUSCAR] 05973470 (Generated: 10/11/2023 18:58:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DEL VAUGHN - VOLVO0072
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70F 25677\Transmission (Auto) [VCP360806] 05 Oct 2023 @ 13939.0 hrs

