
[[S50401813-1 KRAMAR]] VOLVO EC350E 314226 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP415365
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: S50401813-1 KRAMAR

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT22099 KNABE ROADCORONA, CAUS  92883Contact: MIKE BUCKMIKE.BUCK@VCESVOLVO.COMT: F: (951)277-4550
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil viscosity is lower thannormal. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO4486Unique No: 10686758Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 13 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 05974808 (Generated: 10/23/2023 14:48:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE BUCK - VOLVO4486

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415365 VCP340673 --- ---Sample Date 04 Oct 2023 03 Dec 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 2500 819 --- ---Oil Hours 0 819 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 10.4 12.5 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.3 5 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 42 69 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0 0.1 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 37 74 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 43 65 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % 1.8 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 3 22 --- ---Sodium ppm 1 4 --- ---Potassium ppm 3 4 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 16 --- ---Copper ppm 3 360 --- ---Lead ppm 1 2 --- ---Tin ppm 2 4 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 39 12 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 3 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 712 2201 --- ---Magnesium ppm 688 151 --- ---Zinc ppm 1013 1088 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 832 904 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 0 7 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 05974808 (Generated: 10/23/2023 14:48:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE BUCK - VOLVO4486
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350E 314226\Diesel Engine [VCP415365] 04 Oct 2023 @ 2500.0 hrs

