
[[113054114]] VOLVO L90H 624620 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP414039
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT (GREEN)
Job No: 113054114

GAINES & CO526 THREE SISTERS RDKNIGHTDALE, NCUS  27545Contact: BEAR PERONEgperone@gainesandco.comT: (919)524-4711F: (919)944-0091
Diagnosis
We recommend drain/flush system,and refill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. There is a lightconcentration of oil present in thecoolant. The carboxylate level of thisfluid is acceptable. Glycol and nitritelevels are acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: GAIKNIUnique No: 10688192Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 16 Oct 2023
Report Id: GAIKNI [WUSCAR] 05976242 (Generated: 10/20/2023 11:40:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BEAR PERONE - GAIKNI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414039 --- --- ---Sample Date 04 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2499 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 9.91 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 49.4 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -33 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance oil --- --- ---Coolant Color Red --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GAIKNI [WUSCAR] 05976242 (Generated: 10/20/2023 11:40:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BEAR PERONE - GAIKNI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 624620\Coolant [VCP414039] 04 Oct 2023 @ 2499.0 hrs

