
[[606727 MORETRENCH EN]] VOLVO SD115B 237093 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP426152
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 606727 MORETRENCH EN

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: JOHN FARDELLAjohn.fardella@altg.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. No other corrective action isrecommended at this time.Metallevels are typical for a componentsfirst oil change. Elevated aluminum(Al) and/or lead (Pb) and potassium(K) levels in your metals analysis arelikely a result of solder flux releaseinto the lubricant and is common onnew equipment/components. Lightfuel dilution occurring. No othercontaminants were detected in theoil. The BN result indicates that thereis suitable alkalinity remaining in theoil. The condition of the oil is suitablefor further service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10688791Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 16 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05976841 (Generated: 10/29/2023 02:59:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP426152 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 894 --- --- ---Oil Hours 894 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.4 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 76 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 78 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 58 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 2.5 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 23 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 52 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 36 --- --- ---Copper ppm 39 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm 4 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 23 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 32 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1645 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 396 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1071 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 845 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 15 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05976841 (Generated: 10/29/2023 02:59:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO SD115B 237093\Diesel Engine [VCP426152] 15 Sep 2023 @ 894.0 hrs

