
[[X45595 IRON SMART]] VOLVO A40G 341548 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP434801
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: X45595 IRON SMART

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Lavergne1231 BRIDGESTONE PARKWAYLAVERGNE, TNUS  37086Contact: BILLY BEARDjbeard@scottcompanies.comT: F: (615)793-9655
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofmetal. Resample at the next serviceinterval to monitor. We were unableto perform a particle count due tometal particles present in thissample.Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. All componentwear rates are normal. No othercontaminants were detected in theoil. The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO0129Unique No: 10695505Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 16 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 05978210 (Generated: 10/17/2023 14:28:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BILLY BEARD - VOLVO0129

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP434801 --- --- ---Sample Date 10 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 8084 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.7 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.802 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1254 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 722 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 600 --- --- ---Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 05978210 (Generated: 10/17/2023 14:28:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BILLY BEARD - VOLVO0129
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 341548\Hydraulic System [VCP434801] 10 Oct 2023 @ 8084.0 hrs

