
[[W02007587]] VOLVO EC350 314266 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP416084
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD 85W140
Job No: W02007587

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - MANASSAS8450 QUARRY ROADMANASSAS, VAUS  20110Contact: MIKE MAYHUGHMMAYHUGH@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: (703)393-7344F: (703)393-7844
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0002Unique No: 10697296Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 18 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 05980001 (Generated: 10/27/2023 05:10:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416084 VCP386335 VCP361829 VCP338915Sample Date 29 Sep 2023 08 Nov 2022 02 Jun 2022 28 Dec 2021Machine Hours 2987 1987 1102 493Oil Hours 1000 1000 1000 493Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 244 152 169 177
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 2 27 5 10Sodium ppm 0 <1 2 2Potassium ppm 1 0 0 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 19 107 107 331Copper ppm 2 4 8 43Lead ppm 0 0 2 <1Tin ppm 0 0 1 0Aluminum ppm <1 6 1 2Chromium ppm 0 1 2 7Molybdenum ppm 10 18 15 <1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 1 2 7Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 249 543 611 8Magnesium ppm 96 215 170 2Zinc ppm 241 387 368 30Phosphorus ppm 518 954 951 291Barium ppm 0 0 0 1Boron ppm 71 139 140 2

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 05980001 (Generated: 10/27/2023 05:10:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350 314266\Swing Drive [VCP416084] 29 Sep 2023 @ 2987.0 hrs

