
[[W02007603]] VOLVO EC350 314263 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP416078
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD 85W140
Job No: W02007603

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - MANASSAS8450 QUARRY ROADMANASSAS, VAUS  20110Contact: MIKE MAYHUGHMMAYHUGH@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: (703)393-7344F: (703)393-7844
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0002Unique No: 10697302Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 18 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 05980007 (Generated: 10/27/2023 05:11:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416078 VCP390638 VCP320920 ---Sample Date 04 Oct 2023 24 Jan 2023 03 Nov 2021 ---Machine Hours 2977 1954 536 ---Oil Hours 1000 1000 536 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 253 266 176 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % --- --- 0.155 ---Silicon ppm 3 2 3 ---Sodium ppm 0 1 1 ---Potassium ppm 2 <1 10 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 48 21 28 ---Copper ppm 2 4 2 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 8 4 0 ---Nickel ppm <1 0 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm <1 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 213 151 2 ---Magnesium ppm 87 34 <1 ---Zinc ppm 202 116 12 ---Phosphorus ppm 569 871 195 ---Barium ppm 0 0 2 ---Boron ppm 82 157 10 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 05980007 (Generated: 10/27/2023 05:11:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350 314263\Swing Drive [VCP416078] 04 Oct 2023 @ 2977.0 hrs

