
VOLVO A40G 352682 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP407337
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

LANDMARK CONSTRUCTION CO. INC./MEM3255 INDUSTRY DRIVENORTH CHARLESTON, SCUS  29418Contact: GENE RICHARDSONgrichardson@landmark-sc.comT: (843)767-9741F: (843)767-9909
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: LANNORUnique No: 10697333Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 18 Oct 2023
Report Id: LANNOR [WUSCAR] 05980038 (Generated: 10/27/2023 07:48:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GENE RICHARDSON - LANNOR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407337 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2121 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 48.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 68 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 6 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 136 --- --- ---Copper ppm 15 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 11 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 29 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 128 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2110 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 85 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LANNOR [WUSCAR] 05980038 (Generated: 10/27/2023 07:48:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GENE RICHARDSON - LANNOR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352682\Drop Box [VCP407337] 27 Sep 2023 @ 2121.0 hrs

