
[[SWO-066610]] VOLVO A60H 340099 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP428924
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46
Job No: SWO-066610

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Please note that this is a correctedcopy for data entry and diagnosticcomment updates.All componentwear rates are normal. There is a highamount of particulates present in theoil. The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10698812Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 20 Oct 2023
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05981517 (Generated: 10/23/2023 01:33:13) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP428924 VCP416646 VCP405923 VCP370849Sample Date 11 Oct 2023 18 Jul 2023 27 Mar 2023 14 Oct 2022Machine Hours 7982 7491 7019 6595Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ATTENTION ATTENTION ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.0 42.9 41.7 41.2Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.47 0.38 0.35 0.39
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 7635 4496 9434 12288Particles >6µm 2596 1539 1208 3827Particles >14µm 169 134 41 201ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/19/15 19/18/14 20/17/13 21/19/15Silicon ppm 5 5 10 11Sodium ppm 2 0 4 <1Potassium ppm 2 2 <1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 10 20 21Copper ppm 3 3 7 8Lead ppm 2 1 0 3Tin ppm <1 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 1 <1 4 3Chromium ppm 2 2 6 6Molybdenum ppm <1 1 <1 1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 105 111 74 86Magnesium ppm 78 8 6 6Zinc ppm 582 463 444 457Phosphorus ppm 433 352 338 346Barium ppm 0 1 0 1Boron ppm 2 0 0 3

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05981517 (Generated: 10/23/2023 01:33:17) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 340099\Hydraulic System [VCP428924] 11 Oct 2023 @ 7982.0 hrs

