
[[SWO-066609]] VOLVO A45G 352916 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP432957
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: SWO-066609

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10698961Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 24 Oct 2023
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05981666 (Generated: 10/27/2023 03:28:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP432957 VCP419147 VCP403259 VCP362535Sample Date 11 Oct 2023 25 Jul 2023 24 Jan 2023 07 Jul 2022Machine Hours 3517 3005 1980 936Sample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.79 7.30 7.36 7.59Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT NT NT 224Percentage Glycol % 47.7 42.4 41.5 43.9Freezing Point °C -28 -17 -15 -19
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal hazy normal normalCoolant Color Yllow Orange Orange Yllow

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05981666 (Generated: 10/27/2023 03:28:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352916\Coolant [VCP432957] 11 Oct 2023 @ 3517.0 hrs

