
[[9774 BALTIMORE SCRAP]] VOLVO L110E 60250 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP413684
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40
Job No: 9774 BALTIMORE SCRAP

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO INC MAIN4601 WASHINGTON BOULEVARDBALTIMORE, MDUS  21227Contact: MARK CIULLAmciulla@mcclung-logan.comT: (410)242-6500F: (410)242-7835
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Light fuel dilutionoccurring. No other contaminantswere detected in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0150Unique No: 10699463Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 19 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 05982168 (Generated: 10/20/2023 07:03:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413684 VCP171994 VCP142385 VCP153248Sample Date 16 Oct 2023 02 Dec 2014 15 Apr 2014 07 Aug 2013Machine Hours 15314 10609 10084 9562Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.7 12.51 12.65 14.07Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.5 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 33 60 60 56
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 0.2 0 0Nitration (PA) % 47 67 67 58Sulfation (PA) % 40 53 50 47Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 4.2 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 7 4 6Sodium ppm 0 61 6 23Potassium ppm 0 19 2 10
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 0 8 7 7Copper ppm <1 35 2 4Lead ppm 0 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm <1 2 1 2Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 46 42 45Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 0Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 2 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2074 1305 1234 1285Magnesium ppm 45 785 734 809Zinc ppm 1042 982 965 1019Phosphorus ppm 853 861 830 909Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm 4 23 33 38

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 05982168 (Generated: 10/20/2023 07:03:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110E 60250\Diesel Engine [VCP413684] 16 Oct 2023 @ 15314.0 hrs

