
VOLVO L250H 1038 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP443117
Oil Type: Hydraulic System Oil
Job No:

113 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - GARNER3561 JONES SAUSAGE ROADGARNER, NCUS  27529Contact: TRENT BROADWELLtrent.broadwell@ascendummachinery.comT: (919)661-8817F: (919)661-9038
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is a lightamount of silt (particulates < 14microns in size) present in the oil. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.The condition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO0157Unique No: 10699618Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 19 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0157 [WUSCAR] 05982323 (Generated: 10/27/2023 04:38:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TRENT BROADWELL - VOLVO0157

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP443117 VCP414948 VCP426631 VCP367460Sample Date 17 Oct 2023 29 Aug 2023 12 Apr 2023 03 Jan 2023Machine Hours 19417 19087 18265 17646Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ATTENTION NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.6 42.5 40.1 40.3Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.41 0.53 0.52 0.56
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 5110 1641 --- 42476Particles >6µm 1817 376 --- 10299Particles >14µm 140 39 --- 582ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/18/14 18/16/12 --- 23/21/16Silicon ppm 5 4 11 10Sodium ppm 2 0 <1 <1Potassium ppm 0 2 2 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 5 11 11Copper ppm <1 1 2 2Lead ppm 0 <1 1 1Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 1 2 4 4Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 0 <1 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 362 390 764 802Magnesium ppm 52 50 111 53Zinc ppm 585 595 790 706Phosphorus ppm 472 461 641 560Barium ppm 0 2 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 0 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0157 [WUSCAR] 05982323 (Generated: 10/27/2023 04:38:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TRENT BROADWELL - VOLVO0157
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L250H 1038\Hydraulic System [VCP443117] 17 Oct 2023 @ 19417.0 hrs

