
[[367252 ALTER]] SENNEBOGEN 835 835.0.2949 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP396388
Oil Type: SENNEBOGEN/MAYBE SHELL ISO 46
Job No: 367252 ALTER

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY1035 WYLIE DRIVEBLOOMINGTON, ILUS  61705Contact: JUSTIN PERRYjustin.perry@altg.comT: (309)533-9285F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The amountand size of particulates present in thesystem are acceptable. Viscosity ofsample indicates oil is within ISO 32range, advise investigate. Confirm oiltype. The AN level is acceptable forthis fluid.

Depot: VOLVO5054Unique No: 10699625Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 24 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO5054 [WUSCAR] 05982330 (Generated: 10/27/2023 02:56:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUSTIN PERRY - VOLVO5054

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP396388 --- --- ---Sample Date 10 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4362 --- --- ---Oil Hours 4362 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 33.16 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.99 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 1049 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 370 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 51 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 17/16/13 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 7 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1197 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 8 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 679 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 562 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5054 [WUSCAR] 05982330 (Generated: 10/27/2023 02:56:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUSTIN PERRY - VOLVO5054
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835 835.0.2949\Hydraulic System [VCP396388] 10 Oct 2023 @ 4362.0 hrs

